
ORDINANCE 2005-07

ANORDINANCE TOAMEND ORDINANCE 99-10ESTABLISHING APROCEDURE FOR
THEPURCHASING, SALEOREXCHANGE OFPROPERTY INTHECITYOF
CHEROKEE VILLAGE, ARKANSAS; ANDFOROTHER PURPOSES.  

BEITORDAINED BYTHECITY COUNCIL OFTHE CITY OFCHEROKEE
VILLAGE, ARKANSAS:  

SECTION 1. TheMayor, orhisdulyauthorized representative, shall haveexclusive
powerandresponsibility tomakepurchases ofallsupplies, apparatus, equipment, materials and
otherthingsrequisite topublicpurposes fortheCityofCherokee Village, Arkansas andto
makeallnecessary contracts forworkorlabortobedone, ormaterial orothernecessary thingsto
befurnished forthebenefitoftheCitywhere theamountoftheexpenditure foranypurchase
orcontract doesnotexceed thesumofTenThousand Dollars ($10,000.00). (A.C.A. § 14-58- 
303(a); A.C.A. § 14-58-303(b)(1)(A))  seealso

SECTION 2. Where theamountofexpenditure foranypurchase orcontract exceeds the
sumofTenThousand Dollars ($10,000.00), theMayor, orhisdulyauthorized representative,  
shall invitecompetitive bidsthereonbylegaladvertisement inanylocalnewspaper. Bids
received pursuant tosaidadvertisement shallbeopened andreadonthedatesetforreceiving
saidbidsinthepresenceoftheMayor, orhisdulyauthorized representative. Thecontract may
beawarded tothelowest responsible bidder; however, theMayororhisrepresentative mayreject
anyandallbidsreceived. (A.C.A. § 14-58-303(b)(2)(A)(i)-(iii)  

SECTION 3. TheMayor, orhisrepresentative, mayapprove forpayment outofany
fundspreviously appropriated forthatpurpose ordisapprove anybills, debtsorliabilities
asserted claimsagainst theCitywhenfundsonhandareadequate topaysuchbills, debtsoras
liabilities. Thatthepayment ordisapproval ofanybills, debtsorliabilities notcovered bya
previous appropriation shall require confirmation ofthegoverning body. (A.C.A. § 14-58-  
305 (a), (b)  

SECTION 4. ThattheMayor, orhisdulyauthorized representative, maysellor
exchange anymunicipal supplies, materials orequipment without competitive bidding ifsuch
supplies, materials orequipment haveavalueoflessthanFiveHundred Dollars ($500.00). No
supplies, materials orequipment shallbesoldwithout receiving competitive bidstherefore ifthe
valuethereofexceeds thesumofFiveHundred Dollars ($500.00); provided, however, ifthe
Mayorshallcertify inwriting tothegoverning bodythat, inhisopinion, thefairmarket valueof
such itemorlot (tobedisposed ofinoneunit) islessthanTenThousand Dollars ($10,000.00),  
thesamemaybesoldbytheMayorwithout competitive bidding. (A.C.A. § 14-58-306(a), (b);  

A.C.A. § 14-58-303). Pursuant toA.C.A. § 14-58-303(b)(2)(B) thegoverning body, byseealso
ordinances maywaivetherequirements ofcompetitive bidding inexceptional situations where
thisprocedure isdeemed notfeasible orpractical.  

SECTION Ifanyprovision5. ofthisordinance ortheapplication thereof toanyperson
isheldinvalid, suchinvalidity shallnotaffectotherprovisions orapplications oforcircumstance
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theordinance which canbegiven effect without theinvalid provision orapplication, andtothis
endtheprovisions ofthisordinance aredeclared tobeseverable.  

SECTION 6. Allordinances orpartsofordinances inconflict arehereby repealed.  

PASSED ANDAPPROVED BYTHECHEROKEE VILLAGE CITY COUNCIL.  

DATED: December 15, 2005
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